































































































0 %j [Q : [O—g o }M*«["
i O(&mﬂf \Lu\J Ly
JOffD/)wb&M 'Mah _gL ng t&mgggcm
| )\\)Y‘ P P o

\\ 0 \ill){ . ) U\) L“‘p(

vyl

‘ *)l,f Qvgg ey s
200008 Daie | Eame e

e




B

: : : s tert
RANGELINE I WORK ORDER aa dd C FUEF 220
i DATE Invoice # T ] L) ket
nvoice 4 - // ! } Fe s 5"\
Rangeline Tapping Services, Inc. 11/1/2017 FL-257573-]
P.O. Box 210155
Royal Palm Beach. FL 33421
Ph 1-800-346-597]1 Fax 561-798-2113
BILL TO P.O.#
A Jié —~
Killebrew. Inc. iy (& > 77w oceni308
P.O. Box 6258 0, ALV S
Lakeland, FL. 33807-6258 Ting Sy Ve ik s Bty
TERMS PROJECT Tech Office
NET 30 EMERGENCY- OC N. Sparkman Ave. Hydrant ic SH
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION )
6 DLS 1 6" Double Linestop Class WM (Comp) (I & T Done 10.31.17) W
EMERGENCY <
/,
Fitting: : oD: THK: /4
> s

Comp. plug: eaded ) Pinned

Leading Edge: Cheaters: " Wheels:
Pressure Test held for 15 min:

Tech’s Name: J /95'-7/\

Inspector’s Name:

On-Site Contact: Juan (863) 899-1459

CITY: Orange City 32763

LOCATION: 1900 N. Sparkman Ave.

TIME: 10:00am

A:ri\‘ed:‘ﬁ.ita Started: /0. O Finished: L}_C

Reason for, Delay (if any):
Trip #: /

Contractor Sign: @ Print:
_F
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 RANGELINE j

Rangeline Tapping Services. Inc.
P.O. Box 210155

WORK ORDER

DATE Invoice =

10/31/2017 |  FL-257573-1

Royal Palm Beach, FL 33421
Ph 1-800-346-5971 Fax 561-798-2113

Comp. plug: Threaded / Pinned

Leading Edge: _——  Cheaters: _— Wheels: _——
Pressure Test held for 15 min:

Tech’s Name: %p

Inspector’s Name:

On-Site Contact: Juan (863) 899-1459
CITY: Orange City 32763
LOCATION: 1900 N. Sparkman Ave.

TIME: 1:00 PM

R ?r‘»—\\

Am\edz /Df Staned /;’{! Finished: 3

Reason for Delay (if any):_T0: ,‘ e Ql ‘Lgfj?'
Trnp#._  /

Contractor Sign: ~___ Print:

BILL TO P.O. 2
\ — . 2,
Killebrew. Inc. C C t: VV’_; ! g L/ =
P.O. Box 6258 A5 Aok &% 1) & }\ )
Lakeland. F1. 33807-6258 aiabas ARSUII BRI AL TV L7 PP /M‘Ft’f'w/
TERMS PROJECT Tech Office
Cash EMERGENCY- OC N. Sparkman Ave. Hydram BAP VLP
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION
6 DLS 1 6" Double Linestop Class WM (1& T)
EMERGENCY
55
Fitting: &le 5%l 1D: _ — OD: — THK: __~—



Cathy Hurd

From: Rick Brzezinski

Sent: Wednesday, November 1, 2017 3:.09 PM

To: Cathy Hurd

Subject: Re: Emergency Repair - North Sparkman Main break this morning

No price yet but invoice will be marked as the following.
North Sparkman Hydrant Emergency

Thanks Rick

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S7. an AT& T 4G LTE smartphone

———————— Original message --------

From: Cathy Hurd <churd(@ourorangecity.com>

Date: 10/31/17 1:35 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: Rick Brzezinski <rbrzezinski{@ourorangecity.com>

Cc: Raul Palenzuela <rpalenzuelai@ourorangecity.com>. Migdalia Hernandez <mhernandez(@ourorangecity.com>,
Christine Davis <cdavis@ourorangecity.com>

Subject: RE: Emergency Repair - North Sparkman Main break this morning

Rick,
We will be using PO#15279 for Killebrew on this repair. Please forward the estimate to me as soon as you get it.

Thank you!

Hds was u‘:t’crf ) 3
Gty for Gillepce's Bufod fepar

From: Migdalia Hernandez

Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2017 12:07 PM

To: Christine Davis <cdavis@ourorangecity.com>

Cc: Rick Brzezinski <rbrzezinski@ourorangecity.com>; Raul Palenzuela <rpalenzuela@ourorangecity.com>; Cathy Hurd
<churd@ourorangecity.com>

Subject: RE: Emergency Repair - North Sparkman Main break this morning

Christine,
Cathy will issue a PO and we are pending repair cost. TY

Migdalia Hernandez
Public Works Director
City of Orange City
426 S. Volusia Avenue
Orange City, FL 32763

(386) 775-5446

From: Rick Brzezinski
Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2017 11:12 AM



INVOICE #:

TO OWNER: CITY OF ORANGE CITY P.O. NO: 15353

205 E. GRAVES AVE
ORANGE CITY. FL 32763

FROM CONTRACTOR KILLEBREW, INC

P O. BOX 6258
LAKELAND, FL 33807-6258  VIA OWNER:
VIA PROFESSIONAL:
PROJECT NAME: N. Sparkman Ave. Emergency Repair

18-103 INV. DATE: January 29, 2018

APPLICATION NO.: 1 Final Invoice DISTRIBUTION TO:
PERIOD TO: January 29, 2018 XX |OWNER
PROJECT NO.: OCEM1803 EPROFESS!ONAL
BIDICONTRACT NO.; 0 GENERAL
CONTRACT DATE: CONTRACTOR

Cathy Hurd via email: churd@ourorangecity com

APPLICATION IS MADE FOR PAYMENT, AS SHOWN BELOW. IN CONNECTION WITH THE
CONTRACT. CONTINUATION SHEET IS ATTACHED

1

oo W

wo~N®

ORIGINAL CONTRACT SUM $29,639 49
NET CHANGE BY CHANGE ORDERS 3000
CONTRACT SUM TO DATE $29,639 49
TOTAL COMPLETED & STORED TO DATE $29,639 49
RETAINAGE:

A 0% OF COMPLETED WORK $0.00

B 0% OF STORED MATERIALS $0.00

TOTAL RETAINAGE $0.00
TOTAL EARNED LESS RETAINAGE $29,639.49
LESS PREVIOUS CERTIFICATES FOR PAYMENT $0.00
CURRENT PAYMENT DUE $29,639.49
BALANCE TO FINISH, INCLUDING RETAINAGE $0.00

————— —
THE UNDERSIGNED CONTRACTOR CERTIFIES THAT TO THE BEST OF THE. CONTRACTOR'S

KNOWLEDGE INFORMATION AND BELIEF THE WORK COVERED BY THIS APPLICATION FOR ¢
HAS BEEN COMPLETED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE CONTRACT DOCUMENTS, THAT ALL AM(}
HAVE BEEN PAID BY THE CONTRACTOR FOR WORK FOR WHICH PREVIOUS CERTIFICATES F
PAYMENT WLRE 1SSUCD AND PAYMLNTS RECEIVED FROM THE OWNER. AND THAT CURRFEN|
PAYMENT SHOWN HIE REIN IS NOW DUE

NOSHIONIN 35iN30

o

CONTRACTOR: KILLEBREW, INC Egg

~g g
av: Lo b 10 (A 55— oatE: LD, F1 B
CINDY D. ADAMSON, SECRETARY / Foo
STATE OF FLORIDA 3 3E
COUNTY OF:  POLK — B
SUBSCRIBED IAND SWORN TO BEFORE ME THIS N E
DAY OF L, Ly e H

I [ S

NOTARY PUBLIC '&, L \u 0 Oy O s

MY COMMISSION EXPIRE: DENiSE HENDERSON

‘g
Q‘W\\A X

RECOMMENDATION FOR PAYMENT

PAYMENT OF THE ABOVE AMOUNT DUE THIS APPLICATION IS RECOMMENDED

AMOUNT RECOMMENDED: $
PROFESSIONAL

BY DATE:
OWNER:

BY: DATE:

THIS CERTIFICATE 1S NOT NEGOTIABLE THE AMOUNT CERTIFIED IS PAYABLE ONLY TO THE

CONTRAC TOR NAMED HEREIN ISSUANCE PAYMINT AND ACCEPTANCE OF PAYMENT ARE WITHOUT

PREJUDICE OF THE OWNCR OR CONTRACTOR UNDER THIS CONTRACT




Schedule of Values

Project Name: N. Sparkman Ave. Emergency Repair

Invoice No.: 18-103

Killabrew, Inc.

PO Box 6258

Owner: City of Orange City Date: January 29, 2018 Lakeland, FL 33807
Pay Application No.: 1 Final Invoice Killebruw Project No.: OCEM1803 Tel (863} 1010273
Owner's Purchase Order No.. 15353 Owner's Bid/Contract No.* Fax: (B63) 701-0621
a b [ ] e ! g [ n l | I 1 [ K l 1 m n o p q r
Work Completed
Scheduled Values Pnor E: This Estimate Tolal to Dale Stored
Total
Pror Stored | Less Pmit For New Completed
Inslailed Oty Total Installed) .S P ¥ and Stored 10 % Balance to
Uit of Total § {k from last Totai, $ Total § Oty Total, $ (mensofrom | Stored Malls | Slored this Date,§ | Complete| Fimsh §
liem No Description Qy Unit Price, $ cxe) est) (gxe) Instaiied Qty. (1xe) g+ (k x &) lasiest) | now insitafied, $ | Estmate. 3 | (+ménco) /N if-p)
Pipe Criw 24 hes @ $350/Hr ($3 500/0ay
1 based on 10 hr day) 74 HR 335C 00 $8.400.00 $0 00 24 $8 40000 24 $8,400 00 $8.400 00 100 00% 3000
Punch Drew 18 hrs @ $250Mr (32,500/day
2 based on 10 hr day) A1) HR $250 00 $4,500 00 50 00 18 $4,500.00 18, $4,500.00 $4,50000 100 00% 30.00
3 Flagners 20 hrs & $100/Hr (2 flagoers) 20 HR 310000 32,000 c0 $000 20 $2.000 DO 20| 3$2.000.00 4200000 100.00% $0.00
4 St Augushine Sod. 45 SY @ S3ISY 45 sY $300 $13500 5000 45 $135.00 45 $135.00 $13500 | 100.00% $000
5 Double G Line Stop. 1 LS @ $11.500.00 1 LS 511,500 00 $11,500 00 5000 1| $11.500.00 1 $11.500 00 $11.50000 | 100.00% $0.00
N 118 (per rs)
[} (@ 3409 99 1 LS $409 99 $400 99 5000 1 3400 08 ! $409.99 $40999 | 100.00% $0 00
7 10% OHP 1 EA 32 644 50 $72,694 50 $0.00 i 52,694 50 1 $2.604 50 $2,694 50 | 100 00% $0 00
Grand Totals $29,639.49 $0.00 $29.639.49 $29,639.49 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $29.639.49 | 100.00% $0.00

ragot o7




———

a b < I d l e [ ] q 4[ h ! J I k I 1 m l n I 0 p
Work Comp
Scheduled Values Prios Estimale This Estmale Total o Date Slored Malenals

Totul
Prior Stored | Less Pmit For New Completad
Installed Oty Total Instalied Malenals, $ Previously Matenals | and Stored to % Dalance 1o
Unil of Total, § (k from last Tolal, § Total, § Qty Total, $ {men+otrom | Stored Matls Stared this Date.$ Complete Fingh, §
lem No Descnpbon Qty Measure | Uni Poce, § {cxe) es1) (gxe) Inslalied Qty. (1x ) {9+ (kxe) lasiest) | now instalied, § | Estmale. 3 | (lsmen+o) prn {-p

Contract & Invoice Si ry Change Order

Y Stored Materials Si Y

1. Ongmal contract amount .$29,639.48

s |__MemMNo | Descnpbon | Quantty | UOM Ut | Extended s

_....3000

3 Work qomnplese i e feien O ORTIDDL. .o coiavsisuminsiminess SR BN - o0 v} PSSRV SRR R UR RIS i e i N R A e e s i s O
4. New slored malenals s estimate (SUm of COUMNOL . _._...vmreccerrenrcseorscsseine e . 50004 — e T S MnNP—— I B (SRR = —
5. Less prior slored matenals that are now installed (sum of columnn) . 300008 .. A e A S 54 s S, ReR .50.00

6 Retanagerate ... = OSSOSO SUPRT. ..

7. Relainage wihheld for work & new siored matls in thvs estmate (6 x (3+4:5)), = .

s - o e o S B e S 40 bt VPRSP FASRESS| [NSSRPIEIENS ) [ERPEEI CORTR.. . . !
9., Work & stored matenals compieied fo dale (suin of column p), ] $28,639.49 5 - T, S LR S SRR, i TP, [T $0.00.

& slore

Tolal of change orders lo date 3000 fTolal of stored malenals to date 30 00

Pago 2 ot 2




